
Welcome to the Trimley St Mary Parish Council news September 
2024

Trimley St Mary Population 3,830

Fundraising Quiz: Together with Trimley St Mary neighbourhood 
watch we are putting on a quiz to raise funds for the Christmas 
light switch event. 

Saturday October 26th Welcome Hall Trimley, doors open 6.30pm 
for 7pm start

Teams of 4 or 6 £6.00 per person. Tickets in advance.

Bring your own drinks & nibbles

There will be a cash raffle

Tickets available 
from welcomehall1902@gmail.com 07886176164



We will be asking local business for questions and are very 
grateful for raffle prizes or donations. Thank you to Suffolk Sound 
Radio who has donated the Christmas Tree. 

Mens Cycle Tour:On Sunday 8 September the final stage of 2024 
Lloyds Bank Tour of Britain, will be coming  through our village 
very fast on their way to the final finish at Felixstowe, lets cheer 
them along the way. 

Heritage open Weekend: There will be an opportunity to see 
some of the historical photographs and documents of the Trimley 
villages collated by the very dedicated Trimley St Martin recorder 
Liz Rastrick. There will be an exhibition at 2 Two Sisters Arts 
Centre, also known as Trimley St. Mary Church on 7th and 8th 
September over Heritage Weekend. As well as photographs it will 
include living history and a very special opportunity to look 
deeper into the lives of those who died during the two World 
Wars, courtesy of Barbara Shout.  Free Entry

Drinking water tap:To help reduce single use water bottles we 
have installed a public drinking water bottle filling tap at the 
Welcome Hall for all to use. The tap is situated down the left hand 
side.Theres a doggy bowl there too.

Roseberry Café :Our Council again this year were able to offer 
financial support to the great team at Roseberry Café  who run 
from our trusts land at Stennetts playing field, over the school 
holidays they offered free lunches and activities on Wednesdays.
The Café  is open every Wednesday for drinks, scones, cakes & 
lunches.
Please can we remind you that dogs are not permitted on the trust 
land as this is a playing field.

https://www.facebook.com/profile.php?id=100057138322921&__cft__%5B0%5D=AZU4QUL9dq773pcpMuAZL2zky1_PX8H6Q0hPN_ovSSTpMwerj-F2T9lz703XiDkwIivw17-GL31LxBSNEYOUxYIc1msy9suQ_jkd4kHeLhDhGmxcJxcE2UThS521F-_y7xn8BBMsQ1NIzGSoFeRei5g8ssJ-07oErMMhIjYlEzlyaI2aFS38g61nH46M73jwRW8&__tn__=-%5DK-R
https://www.facebook.com/profile.php?id=100057138322921&__cft__%5B0%5D=AZU4QUL9dq773pcpMuAZL2zky1_PX8H6Q0hPN_ovSSTpMwerj-F2T9lz703XiDkwIivw17-GL31LxBSNEYOUxYIc1msy9suQ_jkd4kHeLhDhGmxcJxcE2UThS521F-_y7xn8BBMsQ1NIzGSoFeRei5g8ssJ-07oErMMhIjYlEzlyaI2aFS38g61nH46M73jwRW8&__tn__=-%5DK-R


Welcome Hall: Slots are available in the main hall for regular 
hirers and one off hirers. The small meeting room has been 
completed and is available for hire. If you would like to look 
around the small meeting room please email 
lynn.beal@trimleystmary-pc.gov.uk.      for   bookings please contact 
the booking clerk 07824 309712 
thewelcomehallbookings@gmail.com

Meetings: 1st Monday of the month at 7.30pm in the Welcome 
Hall, members of the public always welcome. The Agenda is 
available a few days before and can be found on our Facebook 
page, the website and the noticeboards.

Clerk Nicky Dunn: 07795 824733

clerk@trimleystmary-pc.gov.uk 

www.facebook.com/trimleystmaryparishcouncil 

www.trimleystmary-pc.gov.uk/
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